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BUSINESS PROFILE

Wolf Run Landscapes 
Wolf Run Landscapes is a full-service

landscape company that has been serving
Berks County since 1995. We offer a wide
variety of services from residential
property maintenance to land restoration
and rehabilitation. We enjoy helping out
our local non-profit environmental
groups to give back to our community
and improve the quality of our land and
water. We regularly attend update
training and classes to continue to use
best management practices for our
landscapes and wild lands. Our goal is to
give you quality service with an environ-
mentally friendly approach.

Our landscape service comes in many
forms from maintenance, to design and
installation. We offer tree health care
pruning and removal, proper pruning of
shrubs, garden restoration and installa-
tion, drainage, weeding and mulching,
landscape light installation, water
features, hardscapes from pathways to
large patios and stone walls, stream side
restoration, erosion management, and
invasive pest management.

With 25 years of experience, we design

gardens that are beneficial to wildlife
while giving you the satisfaction of a bold
and beautiful garden. Using different
colors and textures to give you a year-
round beauty of a functional garden.
Non-native plants have flooded the
nurseries which some eventually spread
out of our communities, uncontrolled,
and into the wild taking over our native
plants our wildlife thrive off of. We
landscape with a different approach. Our
land is precious; we must cherish it while
we plant for our enjoyment. It’s our own
duty to be good stewards to our land.

Our hardscaping service offers beauti-
ful natural stone patios, pervious patios,
retaining walls, walkways, staircases, and
much more using natural stone so the
beauty never fades. Natural stone gives
your garden or gathering area a feel-
more connected to earth. Whether it’s a
clean-cut patio or an irregular walkway
the stone can change the way an area
feels. Adding boulders to a landscape can
change the way it reaches out to you.

For additional information, please call
610.779.5717.


